
Note: Keyless entry will unlock the vehicle in
accordance with the current security setting
(Single-point or Multi-point entry). However, if
Single-point entry is the current setting and a
door, other than the driver’s door is opened
first, all of the doors will unlock.

When all of the open doors have been closed,
after entering the vehicle, the system will search
the vehicle's interior for a valid Smart key. If a
valid Smart key is not detected, SMART KEY
NOT FOUND will be displayed in the Message
centre. If this situation occurs, then use a valid
Smart key to carry out the Keyless start backup
procedure. See 101, KEYLESS START BACKUP.

The security system fitted to this vehicle is
Thatcham category 1 approved and meets EU
regulations 97/116 and EU directive 95/56 EC.

INSTRUCTIONAL VIDEO

CONVENIENCE MODE
When a door is opened using either the Smart
key or Keyless entry, the vehicle's electrical
system will initiate the Convenience mode. The
following systems become functional:

• Driver's seat position memory.

• Seat and steering column adjustment.

• Interior and exterior lighting.

• Message centre.

• Auxiliary power sockets.

GLOBAL OPENING
Press and hold the unlock button on the Smart
key for 3 seconds. The vehicle will unlock and
the alarm will be disarmed. After 3 seconds, all
of the windows and the sunroof will open.

To stop window movement during Global
opening when using the Smart key, press any
of the buttons on the Smart key or operate the
driver's window switch. To stop a particular
window from opening, operate the relevant
window switch.

Note: Windows Global Open can be
enabled/disabled via the Vehicle Set-up menu.
See 47, INSTRUMENT PANEL MENU.

DRIVE-AWAY LOCKING
Drive-away locking automatically locks all of
the doors when the vehicle is in motion. This
feature can be enabled/disabled and the speed
at which it activates can be selected, via the
Vehicle Set-up menu. See 47, INSTRUMENT
PANEL MENU.

Note: Pressing the unlock/lock lever on either
of the front doors, after Drive-away locking has
taken place, will override Drive-away locking for
the current journey. See 13, DOOR LOCKS AND
RELEASE LEVERS.

If a door is individually unlocked and opened,
all of the doors will relock when the open door
is subsequently closed.

STEERING COLUMN LOCK
The electric steering column lock will
lock/unlock when the vehicle is locked/unlocked.

If the steering column fails to unlock, a message
will be displayed in the Message centre. If this
occurs, then gently rotate the steering wheel to
the left and the right.
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Entering the vehicle
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https://topix.jaguar.jlrext.com:443/topix/service/procedure/515432/PDF/ee4dd2ea-eaa0-4baf-a47e-27303449a1d6/en_GB?#pagemode=none&toolbar=0&statusbar=0&messages=0&navpanes=0&view=FitH&page=1
https://topix.jaguar.jlrext.com:443/topix/service/procedure/515432/PDF/75822446-116e-4418-9539-91bb7c6f5d3f/en_GB?#pagemode=none&toolbar=0&statusbar=0&messages=0&navpanes=0&view=FitH&page=1
https://topix.jaguar.jlrext.com:443/topix/service/procedure/515432/PDF/75822446-116e-4418-9539-91bb7c6f5d3f/en_GB?#pagemode=none&toolbar=0&statusbar=0&messages=0&navpanes=0&view=FitH&page=1
https://topix.jaguar.jlrext.com:443/topix/service/procedure/515432/PDF/75822446-116e-4418-9539-91bb7c6f5d3f/en_GB?#pagemode=none&toolbar=0&statusbar=0&messages=0&navpanes=0&view=FitH&page=1
https://topix.jaguar.jlrext.com:443/topix/service/procedure/515432/PDF/a28c1e33-b310-4ce3-947f-f084e3830114/en_GB?#pagemode=none&toolbar=0&statusbar=0&messages=0&navpanes=0&view=FitH&page=1
https://topix.jaguar.jlrext.com:443/topix/service/procedure/515432/PDF/a28c1e33-b310-4ce3-947f-f084e3830114/en_GB?#pagemode=none&toolbar=0&statusbar=0&messages=0&navpanes=0&view=FitH&page=1

