
Note: For further information, visit the InControl
section of www.jaguarusa.com.

INCONTROL APPS

In the interests of safety, operate, adjust, or
view the system only when it is safe to do so.

Do not adjust the Touch screen controls, or
allow the system to distract the driver, while
the vehicle is moving. Driver distraction can
lead to accidents, causing serious injury or
death.

InControl Apps allows you to view and operate
approved Smartphone apps through the
vehicle’s Touch screen.

Before using InControl Apps, you will need to
download the InControl Apps Smartphone App.
For Apple’s iPhone®, this can be downloaded

from the Apple App StoreSM. For android
phones, this can be downloaded from Google
Play.

Note: Not all Smartphones are compatible with
InControl Apps. Check the list of compatible
Smartphones and supported apps in the Owners
section of www.jaguarusa.com.

Note: To establish a connection to the vehicle,
the Smartphone must be unlocked and
connected to the USB port.

Note: Make sure that all phone covers and cases
are in the open position. Closed covers or cases
may cause the phone to become locked and,
therefore, prevent connection to InControl Apps.

Note: Before connecting to InControl Apps, it
is recommended that your phone volume is
turned up to the maximum setting.

InControl Apps icon.

To initiate InControl Apps, connect your
Smartphone, using your Smartphone's USB
cable, to the USB port located in the cubby box.
The InControl Apps USB port is identified by
the InControl Apps icon, as illustrated.

Note: iPhone users: When prompted by the
phone, you must give permission to allow the
app. to open.

Note: Android phone users: When prompted by
the phone, you can give permission to always
allow the app. to open.

Once connected, select InControl Apps from
the Touch screen’s HOME menu. You can
navigate to the InControl Apps feature on your
vehicle and any compatible apps will be
displayed on the vehicle’s Touch screen. You
can now open and operate these apps using the
vehicle's Touch screen.

Note: If the ignition or the engine is switched
off, the Bluetooth® connection between the
phone and the vehicle will be disconnected. To
reconnect the phone to the vehicle via
Bluetooth, see 128, PAIRING AND CONNECTING
USING THE PHONE.

Note: Apple and iPhone, are trademarks of
Apple Inc, registered in the U.S. and other
countries. App Store is a service mark of Apple
Inc.
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https://topix.jaguar.jlrext.com:443/topix/service/procedure/514283/PDF/fe1dbc92-d7c1-4004-a05f-e6f0031c79ca/en_GB?#pagemode=none&toolbar=0&statusbar=0&messages=0&navpanes=0&view=FitH&page=1
https://topix.jaguar.jlrext.com:443/topix/service/procedure/514283/PDF/fe1dbc92-d7c1-4004-a05f-e6f0031c79ca/en_GB?#pagemode=none&toolbar=0&statusbar=0&messages=0&navpanes=0&view=FitH&page=1

